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Guernsey is hosting its inaugural Sustainable Finance Week during the week commencing 8th June
as part of its Green Finance Initiative.  There will be an expert panel speaking via webinar on the
subjects of financing sustainability through the lenses of private equity, private capital and family
offices, with daily podcasts.

Tim Clipstone, a group partner in our Guernsey office and Guernsey Green Finance committee
member said: 'The Sustainable Finance Week was due to take place on Guernsey, but is now being
run as a virtual event, with live webinars taking the place of conference keynote speeches and a
daily podcast recapping on highlights of the day.  The events build on Guernsey's leading position as
a centre for sustainable funds and finance, its membership and championing of the UN's FC4S
network, showcasing the Guernsey Green Fund designation, the TISE Green market segment for
listing green bonds and, most recently, the publication of the Green Private Equity Principles – a
best practice guide for GPs of private equity structures.'

Craig Cordle, Tim's fellow Guernsey funds partner, said: 'The event underlines Guernsey's position
both as a leading jurisdiction for private equity funds, but also Guernsey's commitment to green
and sustainable finance. There is no question, as we look beyond the pandemic, that the current
mood music from investors and governments is that sustainability must play an integral role in
shaping any financial recovery – and the Green Private Equity Principles provide GPs and managers
with a fantastic platform on which start that discussion.'

View our infographic on Guernsey Green Funds.

Find out more about the event.

Read about Green Private Equity Principles.

Find out more about FC4S memberships.

Read more on the TISE Green Segment.
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https://www.ogier.com/publications/at-a-glance-guide-to-guernsey-green-fund
https://www.weareguernsey.com/finance-events/2020/sustainable-finance-week/
https://www.weareguernsey.com/literature/green-private-equity-principles/
https://www.fc4s.org/
https://www.tisegroup.com/market/segments/green


 

 

About Ogier

Ogier is a professional services firm with the knowledge and expertise to handle the most
demanding and complex transactions and provide expert, efficient and cost-effective services to
all our clients. We regularly win awards for the quality of our client service, our work and our
people.

Disclaimer

This client briefing has been prepared for clients and professional associates of Ogier. The
information and expressions of opinion which it contains are not intended to be a comprehensive
study or to provide legal advice and should not be treated as a substitute for specific advice
concerning individual situations.

Regulatory information can be found under Legal Notice

Meet the Author

Tim Clipstone

Partner

British Virgin Islands

Guernsey

E: tim.clipstone@ogier.com

T: +44 1481 752265

Key Contacts

2

https://www.ogier.com/legal-notice/
https://www.ogier.com/people/tim-clipstone/
https://www.ogier.com/locations/british-virgin-islands/
https://www.ogier.com/locations/guernsey/
mailto:tim.clipstone@ogier.com
tel:+44 1481 752265


Bryon Rees

Partner

Guernsey

E: bryon.rees@ogier.com

T: +44 1481 752312

Related Services

Investment Funds

Sustainable Investing and Impact Funds

Listing services

Legal

Legal

Related Sectors

Private Equity

Funds Hub

3

https://www.ogier.com/people/bryon-rees/
https://www.ogier.com/locations/guernsey/
mailto:bryon.rees@ogier.com
tel:+44 1481 752312
https://www.ogier.com/expertise/services/legal/investment-funds/
https://www.ogier.com/expertise/services/legal/investment-funds/sustainable-investing-and-impact-funds/
https://www.ogier.com/expertise/services/legal/listing-services/
https://www.ogier.com/expertise/services/legal/
https://www.ogier.com/expertise/services/legal/
https://www.ogier.com/expertise/sectors/private-equity/
https://www.ogier.com/expertise/sectors/funds-hub/

	Guernsey Sustainable Finance Week - June 2020
	News - 05/06/2020
	About Ogier
	Disclaimer
	Meet the Author
	Key Contacts
	Related Services
	Related Sectors


